Fwd: Pledge woo-7797 from Joshua Collingsworth Memorial Foundation

From: Heather Gillon (heathergillon@gmail.com)
To: gillian_bradshaw@yahoo.com

Date: Tuesday, April 23, 2024 at 06:22 PM PDT

Hi Gillian,

| have two receipts for Grant #4799. This is one. It corresponds to the $434.90 on the progress report. I'll send the
other email after this.

Let me know if you have any questions.

~Heather

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joshua Collingsworth Memorial Foundation <quickbooks@notification.intuit.com>
Subject: Pledge woo-7797 from Joshua Collingsworth Memorial Foundation

Date: April 22, 2024 at 7:27:03 AM PDT

To: heathergillon@gmail.com

Reply-To: info@joshuamemorial.org

INVOICE woo-7797 DETAILS

Joshua Collingsworth Memorial Foundation

DUE 10/18/2023
$0.00
Powered by QuickBooks

Dear Heather Gillon,

We appreciate your business. Please find your invoice details



here. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.

Have a great day!
Joshua Collingsworth Memorial Foundation

Bill to Heather Gillon
Laguna Niguel Rotary Club
30562 Via Lindosa
Laguna Niguel, CA 92677

Terms Net 30

Rotary Partner - JTO English Packet $395.00
100 X $3.95

Shipping - USPS $39.90

Tracking ID: 9505 5102 5853 3258 9017 58

1 X $39.90

Payment $434.90

Balance due $0.00

Thank you so much for your purchase and support!!



Joshua Collingsworth Memorial Foundation

8445 Executive Woods Dr Lincoln, NE 68512 US

info@joshuamemorial.org  https://joshuamemorial.org/

If you receive an email that seems fraudulent, please check with the business
owner before paying.

@ quickbooks.
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